
AT THEIR REGULAR MEETING ON WEDNESDAY, NOVEMBER 26, 2025, THE BOARD OF EMMET COUNTY 
ROAD COMMISSIONERS AWARED BIDS IN THE BEST INTEREST OF THE ROAD COMMISSION. 

 

11/25/2025 

Winter Brine 
Bid Tabulation 

 

Bidder Liquid Brine Liquid Organic Cost 

Wilkinson Solutions 
Mayville, MI  

Calcium Chloride Brine  $0.23 / gallon 

Wilkinson Solutions 
Mayville, MI  

 Thermapoint R $0.50 / gallon 

Michigan Chloride Sales, LLC 
St. Louis, MI 

MCS MINERAL WELL 
BRINE 

 
$0.226 / gallon 

*price based on 9,500 gallon load sizes 

Michigan Chloride Sales, LLC 
St. Louis, MI  

 MCS DE-ICE MASTER+ 

$0.586 / gallon 
*9,500 gallon load sizes 

$0.96 / gallon 
*5,000 gallon load sizes 

K-Tech Specialty Coatings 
Ashley, IN 

 Beet-Heet Concentrate 
$2.09 / gallon 

*4,600 gallon minimum 

Great Lakes Chloride, Inc 
Grand Haven, MI 

Meltdown Apex-C  $1.344 / gallon 

Great Lakes Chloride, Inc 
Grand Haven, MI 

Calcium Chloride with 
BOOST 

 $1.236 / gallon 

Great Lakes Chloride, Inc 
Grand Haven, MI 

 BOOST SB $3.073 / gallon 

Liquid Calcium Chloride Sales 
Kawkawlin, MI 

32% Liquid Calcium 
Chloride 

 $0.727 / gallon 

Liquid Calcium Chloride Sales 
Kawkawlin, MI 

 NO BID NO BID 

Chloride Solutions, LLC 
Webberville, MI 

Mineral Well Brine  
$0.85 / gallon 

*minimum 3,000 gallon 

Chloride Solutions, LLC 
Webberville, MI 

 C526 
$1.50 / gallon 

*minimum 2,000 gallon 

Salt Solutions LLC dba Corrigan 
Environmental Solutions 
Whitmore Lake, MI 

Sulli Hot Brine  $0.38 / gallon 

Salt Solutions LLC dba Corrigan 
Environmental Solutions 
Whitmore Lake, MI 

 NO BID NO BID 

Austin Logistics 
Detroit, MI 

23.3% Sodium 
Chloride Liquid Brine 

 $1.28 / gallon 

Austin Logistics 
Detroit, MI 

 

80/20 Blend – 23.3% 
Sodium Chloride Brine + De-
Sugared Beet Juice Organic 

Performance Enhancer 

$1.70 / gallon 
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