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 09/16/2025 

 

25-09 Underbody, Wing, Grader Blades & Plow Shoes 
Bid Tabulation 

Bidder Description Weight*/Foot Price/Foot 

Shults Equipment, LLC 

Ithaca, MI 

1) 5/8" X 8" X 108” Reverse Curved Double Bevel 

2) 5/8" - 7/8" X 8" Curved Double Bevel 

3) 5/8" X 6" Curved Double Bevel Serrated 

4) 5/8” X 8” Curved Double Bevel Serrated 

5) 3/4” X 8” Serrated (3 ½ inch gap) 

6) 5/8” X 8” X 96” Reverse Curved Double Bevel 

7) Wing Shoe-HD Cast Iron Moldboard Shoe 

8) Single Ear Hardened Plow Shoe 

 

1) 16.11 lbs/ft 

2) 19.66 lbs/ft 

3) 8.83 lbs/ft 

4) 12.5 lbs/ft 

5) 10.5 lbs/ft 

6) 16.11 lbs/ft 

  

 

 

1) $19.08 per/ft 

2) $28.05 per/ft 

3) $18.62 per/ft 

4) $23.75 per/ft 

5) $24.86 per/ft 

6) $19.08 per/ft 

7) $168.00 per shoe 

8) $112.00 per shoe 

 

Heights Machinery Inc 

Williamsburg, MI 

1) 5/8" X 8" X 108” Reverse Curved Double Bevel 

2) 5/8" - 7/8" X 8" Curved Double Bevel 

3) 5/8" X 6" Curved Double Bevel Serrated 

4) 5/8” X 8” Curved Double Bevel Serrated 

5) 3/4” X 8” Serrated (3 ½ inch gap) 

6) 5/8” X 8” X 96” Reverse Curved Double Bevel 

7) Wing Shoe-HD Cast Iron Moldboard Shoe 

8) Single Ear Hardened Plow Shoe 

 

1) 15.44 lbs/ft 

2) No Bid 

3) 9.167 lbs/ft 

4) 12.5 lbs/ft 

5)  ? 

6) 15.44 lbs/ft 

 

 

 

1) $19.45 per/ft 

2) No Bid 

3) $17.51 per/ft 

4) $23.61 per/ft 

5) $28.05 per/ft 

6) $19.45 per/ft 

7) $149.00 per shoe 

8) $119.00 per shoe 

 

Truck & Trailer Specialists 

Boyne Falls, MI 

1) 5/8" X 8" X 108” Reverse Curved Double Bevel 

2) 5/8" - 7/8" X 8" Curved Double Bevel 

3) 5/8" X 6" Curved Double Bevel Serrated 

4) 5/8” X 8” Curved Double Bevel Serrated 

5) 3/4” X 8” Serrated (3 ½ inch gap) 

6) 5/8” X 8” X 96” Reverse Curved Double Bevel 

7) Wing Shoe-HD Cast Iron Moldboard Shoe 

8) Single Ear Hardened Plow Shoe 

 

1) 145 lbs/16.1 lbs 

2) 118 lbs/19.66 lbs 

3) 53 lbs/8.83 lbs 

4) 88lbs/12.57 lbs 

5) N/A 

6) 129 lbs/16.12 lbs 

 

8) 57 lbs 

 

1) $170.12 

2) $164.52 

3) $111.62 

4) $161.85 

5) N/A 

6) $152.04 

7) N/A 

8) $119.11 per shoe 

 

Valk Manufacturing Company 

New Kingstown, PA 

1) 5/8" X 8" X 108” Reverse Curved Double Bevel 

2) 5/8" - 7/8" X 8" Curved Double Bevel 

3) 5/8" X 6" Curved Double Bevel Serrated 

4) 5/8” X 8” Curved Double Bevel Serrated 

5) 3/4” X 8” Serrated (3 ½ inch gap) 

6) 5/8” X 8” X 96” Reverse Curved Double Bevel 

7) Wing Shoe-HD Cast Iron Moldboard Shoe 

8) Single Ear Hardened Plow Shoe 

 

NO BID NO BID 

St. Regis Culvert Inc. 

Charlotte, MI 

1) 5/8" X 8" X 108” Reverse Curved Double Bevel 

2) 5/8" - 7/8" X 8" Curved Double Bevel 

3) 5/8" X 6" Curved Double Bevel Serrated 

4) 5/8” X 8” Curved Double Bevel Serrated 

5) 3/4” X 8” Serrated (3 ½ inch gap) 

6) 5/8” X 8” X 96” Reverse Curved Double Bevel 

7) Wing Shoe-HD Cast Iron Moldboard Shoe 

8) Single Ear Hardened Plow Shoe 

 

NO BID NO BID 

Frank Zulski - Chair  
Wade Williams - Vice Chair 2265 E. Hathaway Road 
Jim Kargol - Member Harbor Springs, MI 49740 
Brent Shank, PE Office: (231) 347-8142 
 Engineer-Manager Fax: (231) 347-5787 
Lisa Kleeman www.emmetcrc.org 
 Finance Director 
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AT THEIR REGULAR MEETING ON THURSDAY, SEPTEMBER 18, 2025, THE BOARD OF EMMET COUNTY ROAD 
COMMISSIONERS AWARED BIDS IN THE BEST INTEREST OF THE ROAD COMMISSION. 

Winter Equipment Company, Inc 

Willoughby, OH 

***Arrived after bid opening 

1) 5/8" X 8" X 108” Reverse Curved Double Bevel 

2) 5/8" - 7/8" X 8" Curved Double Bevel 

3) 5/8" X 6" Curved Double Bevel Serrated 

4) 5/8” X 8” Curved Double Bevel Serrated 

5) 3/4” X 8” Serrated (3 ½ inch gap) 

6) 5/8” X 8” X 96” Reverse Curved Double Bevel 

7) Wing Shoe-HD Cast Iron Moldboard Shoe 

8) Single Ear Hardened Plow Shoe 

 

1) 15.44 lbs/ft 

2) 25 lbs/ft 

3) 9 lbs/ft 

4) 24 lbs/ft 

5) 13 lbs/ft 

6) 16 lbs/ft 

7) 32.87 lbs/unit 

 

 

1) $17.13 per/ft 

2) $32.53 per/ft 

3) $16.96 per/ft 

4) $22.86 per/ft 

5) $27.17 per/ft 

6) $18.00 per/ft 

7) $182 per shoe 

8) No Bid 

 


